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When James Sidwell, Marquis of Riverdale, offered to help Elizabeth Hotchkiss
find herself a husband, he never dreamed that the only candidate he could
propose would be himself..
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Editorial Review

Amazon.com Review
Setting: Regency England

Sensuality: 8

Elizabeth Hotchkiss needs to marry a wealthy man, and fast. The oldest child of four well-bred orphans, she's
managed to keep the wolf from their door for years, but she's running out of options. The only marriage
prospect in sight is her landlord, Squire Nevins, but his lecherous gaze makes Elizabeth's skin crawl. So
when she discovers the book How to Marry A Marquis in her employer's library, she impulsively stuffs it
into her reticule and takes it home. Encouraged by her insistent sister, Elizabeth reluctantly agrees to learn
the book's rules well enough to catch a monied husband. But first, she must find a man to practice her wiles
on. Enter James Sidwell, the Marquis of Riverdale. Posing as the new estate manager per his beloved Aunt
Danbury's instructions, he just happens to arrive at the Danbury estate on the very day that Elizabeth
discovers the book. Is it too coincidental that James's Aunt Danbury needs his assistance in catching a
blackmailer at the precise moment that Elizabeth needs a guinea pig? Perhaps, but neither Elizabeth nor
James have reason to suspect that they're being lovingly maneuvered.

James begins to search for a blackmailer, and Elizabeth is high on his list of suspects. While purposely
spending time with her to explore her guilt or innocence, however, he's irresistibly drawn to her beauty and
kindness as well as her practicality and sharp tongue. And when he learns that she's practicing to entice a
husband, he can't resist offering to tutor her in courtship. Before long, the two realize their growing feelings
for each other. But the course of true love never did run smoothly, and the lovers encounter a few obstacles
along the way. Will the evil Squire Nevins easily give up his designs on Elizabeth and her sisters? What
about the nefarious blackmailer? And how will Elizabeth react if she discovers that James is not who he
pretends to be?

How To Marry A Marquis is a delightful read with witty dialogue that sparkles, wonderful secondary
characters--including the difficult Aunt Agatha and an impossibly arrogant cat named Malcolm--sensuous
love scenes, and a hero and heroine that readers will fall in love with. --Lois Faye Dyer

About the Author

Julia Quinn is the New York Times bestselling author of twenty-five novels for Avon Books, and one of only
sixteen authors ever to be inducted in the Romance Writers of America Hall of Fame. She lives in the Pacific
Northwest with her family.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Mellisa White:

The book How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the Crown Book 2) can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the best thing like a book



How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the Crown Book 2)? A few of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer
using your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you could give for each other; you are
able to share all of these. Book How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the Crown Book 2) has simple shape but
the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by start and read
a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Kyle Coffman:

This How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the Crown Book 2) are generally reliable for you who want to be a
successful person, why. The reason why of this How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the Crown Book 2) can
be one of many great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed
you actually with information that might be will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is usually handy,
you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside
that this How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the Crown Book 2) forcing you to have an enormous of
experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day
action. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

David Hedges:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this book. This How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the
Crown Book 2) is simple to create you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If
you did not have got much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make
you easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when you buy this book.

Jack Harbin:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year was exactly
added. This publication How to Marry a Marquis (Agents of the Crown Book 2) was filled concerning
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has
diverse feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a
guide. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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