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Recent, dramatic changes in local and global economies have profoundly
affected the lives of millions and have demanded that students of economy
rethink their analytical approaches. In The Anthropology of Economy, noted
anthropologist Steve Gudeman presents a model and lexicon for thinking about
and discussing "things economic."
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Editorial Review

Review
"This is the first book to propose a cross-cultural model of the economy inspired by anthropology. Gudeman
succeeds magnificently in weaving the results of decades of anthropology into an original synthesis."
Caroline Humphrey, University of Cambridge

"A stimulating rethinking of anthropology's contribution to our understanding of economics. Clear and
original, this highly readable book will disturb many people's habits of thought as well as expand & enrich
them. In it, Gudeman shows how the economy is embedded in human life and society, and how it builds on
community and the commons, as much as on individuality and the market. A signal contribution." Fredrik
Barth, University of Oslo and Boston University

"Given the clarity of the prose and the accessibility of the ideas, this book would make for an excellent
textbook for an economic anthropology class. Indeed, it is hard to think of a textbook that compares. But the
book is much more than this. It is clearly intended as a liberating framework within which anthropologists
and fieldworkers can rethink economic issues in a much broader way." The Australian Journal of
Anthropology

"This is an important work, synthesizing a substantial body of anthropological and economic thought into a
coherent whole." James G. Carrier, Journal of the Royal Anthropological Institute

From the Back Cover
Recent, dramatic changes in local and global economies have profoundly affected the lives of millions and
have demanded that students of economy rethink their analytical approaches. In The Anthropology of
Economy, noted anthropologist Steve Gudeman presents a model and lexicon for thinking about and
discussing "things economic."

This book illustrates that, across cultures, economy can be understood as a combination of both community
and market forces. Drawing from the work of anthropologists, as well as that of economists, sociologists,
historians, geographers, feminists, and post-Marxists, Gudeman presents an anthropological approach to
economy that highlights the centrality of communal processes in the market. His inclusion of over 50 cross-
cultural examples from historical and contemporary contexts will clearly demonstrate to readers the
significance of this distinctive model.

Ultimately, The Anthropology of Economy furnishes readers with a new language for discussing and
reconceptualizing vital contemporary issues - including the emergence and distribution of profit, the effects
of expanding capital on marginalized people and the environment, and our shifting identities in response to
the growth of global markets.

About the Author
Stephen Gudeman is Professor and Chair of the Department of Anthropology, University of Minnesota.
Author of numerous books and articles, including The Demise of A Rural Economy (1978), Economics as
Culture (1986), and Conversations in Colombia: The Domestic Economy in Life and Text (with Alberto
Rivera, 1990), he also edited Economic Anthropology (International Library of Critical Writings in



Economics, 1999).

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Shawn Marsh:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important normally. The book The Anthropology of Economy: Community,
Market, and Culture had been making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The publication The Anthropology of Economy: Community,
Market, and Culture is not only giving you more new information but also being your friend when you truly
feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship together
with the book The Anthropology of Economy: Community, Market, and Culture. You never feel lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Vickie Reed:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will get
large amount of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of
activity do you possess when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time,
often the book you have read is actually The Anthropology of Economy: Community, Market, and Culture.

Phyllis Belser:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Anthropology of Economy: Community,
Market, and Culture can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books
have than the others?

Nancy Collins:

Guide is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen will need book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those publications have
many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. By book The
Anthropology of Economy: Community, Market, and Culture we can get more advantage. Don't someone to
be creative people? To get creative person must love to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that
suited with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book The Anthropology of Economy:
Community, Market, and Culture. You can more inviting than now.
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