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Editorial Review

From the Back Cover

"This book covers a broad subject area yet still has a depth that makes it a valuable resource for anyone
working on intelligent database systems. Good background coverage of both the field of databases and that
of AI are provided in the first part of the book, and later there are some excellent analytical discussions of
relevant projects. The authors adopt a very readable style which enables a complex topic to become much
more accessible."
- Jenny Carter, Department of Computer Science, De Montfort University

This book provides a state of the art guide to the new developments in expert database systems, from the
unique perspective of both the database and AI areas. It gives complete and detailed coverage of the latest
research and practice, including all the need-to-know technical and theoretical approaches in the area.

Drawing on their extensive experience, the authors evaluate how AI techniques can be integrated with
present and future database systems and knowledge based management systems, incorporating AI expertise
into system design. The book also addresses the techniques developed recently which are directly used, or
are the basis, for data retrieval across the world wide web.

If you are a designer or developer working in the database community, with database and AI products or
applications, this book will help you to understand crucial research developments and to apply the results in
practice.

Includes:
· Mechanisms for handling data and knowledge including XML, web indexing, search engines & data mining
· Object Oriented Database Management Systems and object-relational DBMS
· Data modeling including techniques such as Entity Relationship, Functional Data & Semantic Database
models, as well as using the notations for modeling (OMT & UML)

Plus! Extended case studies of commercial systems

About the authors:
Elisa Bertino is a well known expert in the integration of AI and database techniques, areas of O-O,
distributed, deductive and multimedia databases and database security. She has chaired and given tutorials at
many international conferences and published hundreds of journal papers and a book. Elisa is currently a
professor of computer science at the University of Milan.

Barbara Catania is an assistant professor of computer science at the University of Genova, specializing in
deductive and multimedia databases, and indexing techniques in object-oriented and constraint databases.
She has presented at a number of international conferences and co-authored a book.

Gian Piero Zarri is an internationally renowned consultant and researcher in the areas of knowledge-based
systems, natural-language processing, databases and information retrieval systems. He is on the editorial



board of a number of international scientific journals and on the program committee of many conferences on
Knowledge-Based Systems. Gian Piero currently works as Research Director for CNRS, the French National
Centre for Scientific Research.
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Users Review

From reader reviews:

Whitney Mallard:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't would
like do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Intelligent Database Systems. All type
of book are you able to see on many methods. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Peter Robey:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to be smart
in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can help men
and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Intelligent Database Systems book as this
book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred percent guarantees
there is no doubt in it as you know.

Willie Isaac:

The actual book Intelligent Database Systems has a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a
lot of help. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research before write
this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this book.



Jodi Dunn:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It okay you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Intelligent Database Systems
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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